
 

DECEMBER 2, 2019 
 The Board of Supervisors of Clinton County, Iowa, met. Present were Supervisors Srp, Determann and Irwin.  
Minutes of the previous meeting were read and approved. 
 

REPORTS 
 The October 2019 monthly report of the Commission of Veterans Affairs was presented, approved and filed. 
 

 9:00 A.M.  Review Correspondence and Claims 
                   Call to Order – Pledge of Allegiance 
 

 9:15 A.M.  Formal Action & Motions 
 

 CONSENT AGENDA 
 Resolution #2019-313 through #2019-316 and two (2) Motions were approved on the Consent Agenda:    

RESOLUTION #2019-313 
 BE IT RESOLVED by the Clinton County Board of Supervisors that Carey Arndt, d/b/a TYCOGA Vineyard 
& Winery, will electronically file an application for liquor license number WCN000132 with endorsements for 
Outdoor Services and Sunday Sales, effective December 10, 2019. Said application be and is hereby approved by the 
Clinton County Board of Supervisors. 
 

 Roll Call: Irwin: Yes; Determann: Yes; Srp: Yes.     Daniel A. Srp, Chairperson 
 

 RESOLUTION #2019-314 
 WHEREAS, City of Clinton owner by warranty deed of  Parcel 8206440002 since January 30, 2018, has 
received notice of taxes due and delinquent notice of taxes past due.   
 WHEREAS, pursuant to Iowa code 445.63 which reads as follows:  
When taxes are owing against a parcel owned or claimed by the state or a political subdivision of this state and the 
taxes were owing before the parcel was acquired by the state or a political subdivision of this state, the County 
Treasurer shall give notice to the appropriate governing body which shall pay the amount of the taxes due. If the 
governing body fails to immediately pay the taxes due, the Board of Supervisors shall abate all of the taxes. 
 THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED taxes in the sum of $70.00 and all penalties and interest shall be abated 
and the Treasurer is hereby authorized to make amendment to the county records indicating said abated tax for parcel 
820644002 of the City of Clinton.  
 

 Roll Call: Irwin: Yes; Determann: Yes; Srp: Yes.     Daniel A. Srp, Chairperson 
 

RESOLUTION #2019-315 
 WHEREAS, by proceedings in Iowa District Court pursuant to section 657A.10A Tax Sale Certificate 
Holders are entitled  to a refund of their purchase monies. Further pursuant to Iowa code section 445.63 the City of 
Clinton is entitled to abatement of taxes owed as detailed: 
 Clinton  8017090000   433 4th Ave S    $2,588.50      Clinton   8623960000   2200 N 8th St   $5,380.85 
  Clinton  8050670000  422 4th Ave N     $8,187.78        Clinton   8052060000   501 5th Ave N  $10,472.69 
 THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED pursuant to Code of Iowa Sections 445.63 and 657A.10A taxes owing 
shall be abated and the Treasurer is hereby authorized to make amendment to the county records indicating said 
abated tax for the parcels as noted.  
 

 Roll Call: Irwin: Yes; Determann: Yes; Srp: Yes.     Daniel A. Srp, Chairperson 
 

RESOLUTION #2019-316 
 WHEREAS, John M. Newsom has petitioned for property tax suspension under provision of Code of Iowa, 
Section 427.8, on the following described property: 508 5th Avenue N, Clinton, IA            Parcel #8052260000 
 WHEREAS, eligibility for said suspension has been verified by Kim Ralston, CAP Director. 
 BE IT RESOLVED by the Clinton County Board of Supervisors that tax suspension [for the collection of 
taxes, special assessments, and rates or charges, including interest, fees and costs] be and is hereby approved and the 
County Treasurer is authorized to make entry on her records accordingly, all under provision of Section 427.8, Code 
of Iowa. 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that tax suspension under provision of Section 427.8, Code of Iowa, is for the 
2018 Assessment Year and all prior years and it is the responsibility of the petitioning taxpayer to reapply for further 
tax suspension. 
 

 Roll Call: Irwin: Yes; Determann: Yes; Srp: Yes.     Daniel A. Srp, Chairperson 
 

MOTION by Supervisor Determann to authorize the Chairperson to sign Utility Permit Number 10-115 for Eastern 
Iowa Light and Power to install new underground electrical within the county right-of-way located in Section 15 of 
DeWitt South Township, T81N-R4E, along the north and south side of 245th Street. 
 



 

 Roll Call: Irwin: Yes; Determann: Yes; Srp: Yes.     Motion carried. 
 

MOTION by Supervisor Determann to permit the Clinton County Engineer to travel out-of-state to attend the 
following meetings: 

1. National Center for Pavement Preservation Emulsion Task Force Meeting December 3, 2019 (Indianapolis, IN) 
2. NACE Executive Committee meeting February 26-29, 2020 (Washington DC) 
3. NACE Annual Conference April 19-23, 2020 (Baldwin Co, AL)  
4. NACE Executive Committee Fall 2020 Meeting TBD 
 

 Roll Call: Irwin: Yes; Determann: Yes; Srp: Yes.     Motion carried. 
 

 RESOLUTIONS 
 The following resolution was presented and on motion approved: 

RESOLUTION #2019-317 
 WHEREAS, the fiscal year 2019-2020 budget for Clinton County requires a budget amendment as allowed 
per conditions under Iowa Code 331.435; and 
 WHEREAS, it is required per Iowa Code 331.435, Iowa Code 331.434(3) and Iowa Code 331.434(4) to set a 
time and place for a public hearing on the fiscal year 2019-2020 budget amendment to allow taxpayers to present 
objections to or arguments in favor of any part of the budget amendment; now 
 THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Supervisors of Clinton County, Iowa, that a public hearing 
be held on Monday, December 16, 2019, at 9:50 a.m. in the Board of Supervisors Room, Clinton County 
Administration Center, 1900 N. Third Street, Clinton Iowa, for the aforementioned purpose; and 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the County Auditor is hereby directed to cause a publication to be made 
of a notice of the meeting in the official county newspapers and that such publication to be not less than 10 nor more 
than 20 days before the date of the public meeting on the fiscal year 2019-2020 budget amendment.  
 

 Roll Call: Irwin: Yes; Determann: Yes; Srp: Yes.     Daniel A. Srp, Chairperson 
 

 The following resolution was presented and on motion approved: 
RESOLUTION #2019-318 

 WHEREAS, the Clinton County Sheriff’s Office desires to enter into a Memorandum of Understanding 
(MOU) with the Scott County Sheriff’s Office, Davenport, Iowa, to house prisoners at the Clinton County Jail 
Facility, Clinton, Iowa; and 
 WHEREAS, the Sheriff desires the Clinton County Board of Supervisors to authorize the signing of said 
MOU effective December 2, 2019; 
 THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Clinton County Board of Supervisors that the Clinton County 
Sheriff is hereby authorized to sign the MOU, which has been reviewed and approved by the Clinton County 
Attorney. 
 

 Roll Call: Irwin: Yes; Determann: Yes; Srp: Yes.     Daniel A. Srp, Chairperson 
 

RESOLUTION #2019-319 discussion: Supervisor Determann didn’t like that DBI Services bid almost double last 
year and then bid considerably lower this year. Supervisor Irwin said he’s more comfortable with B&W Control 
Specialists considering the history with them and the County and the small difference between the bidders.  
 

 The following resolution was presented and on motion approved: 
RESOLUTION #2019-319 

 WHEREAS, the following quotations were received for Clinton County Secondary Road Department right-of-
way weed spraying, and 
   
 
 
 
 
  

 THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Supervisors of Clinton County, Iowa, that the quote for 
roadside ROW spraying is awarded to:  B&W Control Specialists (50% Blanket Spray and 50% Spot Spray 
Alternate) (Chemicals to be purchased by Clinton County) 
 

 Roll Call: Irwin: Yes; Determann: Yes; Srp: Yes.     Daniel A. Srp, Chairperson 

Contractor Blanket Spray 
50% of west half 
centerline miles 
Total Cost (ALT) 

Spot Spray 50% 
of east half 
centerline miles 
Total Cost (ALT) 

Spot Spray All 
centerline miles 
Total Cost (ALT) 

Purchase Escort 
Per pound 

Purchase 
Milestone Per 
gallon 
 

B&W Control 
Specialists 

$29,500.00 $28,250.00 $56,500.00 $80.00 $325.00 

DBI Services $26,400.00 $29,500.00 $52,700.00 No Bid No Bid 
Crop Production 
Services 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Midwest Spray 
Team  

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 



 

MOTION by Supervisor Determann to authorize the County Auditor to proceed with the implementation of the 
Capital One virtual card relay program. 
 

 Roll Call: Irwin: Yes; Determann: Yes; Srp: Yes.     Motion carried. 
 

 UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
  

 GENERAL PUBLIC  
 

 DEPARTMENT HEADS, ELECTED OFFICIALS AND EMPLOYEES 
County Auditor Eric Van Lancker said he is working on setting up the County Compensation Board to meet on 
January 13. He said he is also working on setting up the January budget schedule. 
County HR Director Dawn Aldridge reported Van Lancker sent her and County Facilities Director Corey Johnson a 
link for ADA training. She has reviewed the training opportunity and it does appear to provide a lot of information. 
She and Johnson discussed it and they would like to attend. She said the total cost would be about $1,200 a person to 
attend.  
Supervisor Determann said he has been in discussions that the state may be looking at a penny sales tax for water 
quality and part of that could be used for mental health services.  
 

DISCUSSION WITH POSSIBLE ACTION  
County Engineer updates:  County Engineer Todd Kinney presented and reviewed a report on several projects in 
County. The report is on file in the Clinton County Auditor’s Office.  
 

County Board/Commission Appointments:  Chairman Srp said he needs to find four more names for the right-of-way 
compensation board appointments. He said he will bring that back for next week’s agenda. Irwin asked to also 
schedule the Pioneer Cemetery appointments for next week’s meeting. The Board considered the Conservation Board 
appointment. Irwin has spoken with all of those who have turned in applications. He said the Board has been 
struggling with the Conservation budget. Irwin said one person is more in tune with how he would like to see 
Conservation move forward. He prefers Brian Grell be appointed to the position as he would be better suited to deal 
with some of the issues in Conservation. Irwin said his County background with budgets and policies will assist the 
Conservation Board. He added Grell is also interested in conservation issues as a hunter. Determann said all 
applicants were great and he is also interested in the fiscal side of the operation right now. Determann doesn’t 
disagree with Irwin, but he was expecting another applicant. Determann suggested that Grell and the other applicant 
should be invited into the boardroom to meet with them. Srp suggested that Irwin and Determann meet with the 
applicants again to make a decision next week. He said the next Conservation Board meeting is the day after the next 
Supervisor meeting. Srp does not want to be the tie breaker on the vote. He said he planned to abstain as he serves on 
the Conservation Board.  
 

Mental Health Region update:  County Mental Health Director Becky Eskildsen and Supervisor Irwin met in 
November with Skyline Center about the region ending funding for sheltered workshops. Eskildsen said the County 
still needs to decide on making the payment to the region. Srp said there was some dispute about how much was 
actually due. Irwin said the Region now hopes to pull all the counties into a meeting in February. He said the meeting 
for next week has been cancelled. Irwin said Muscatine County will pay its first-half funds that are due to the Region. 
He said Muscatine was not allowed in the Southeast Iowa Region. He said it is unsure how that will move forward 
and expects the Department of Human Services to provide direction on that matter. Irwin said Muscatine County 
could still come back into the Eastern Iowa region. Irwin said last week’s meeting was more tense than usual. He 
mentioned during the meeting that Clinton County spoke with another region. Irwin said Scott County is going to 
transfer about $600,000 into the region after the first of the year followed by more payments in the next fiscal year. 
He said that is being done to address funding issues earlier in the life of the Region. Irwin said if this happened a 
month earlier then Muscatine County may not have left the region. Irwin said the 28E discussion will also be 
contentious over an attempt to add language that the levy rate will be the rate the entire region will levy. Eskildsen 
said the FY19 annual report for Clinton County has been submitted to the Iowa Department of Human Services. Irwin 
said the Region is expecting another round of budget cuts to take place in a couple of weeks.    

 11:20 A.M. Drainage Districts – Board of Trustees to discuss Drainage District #23 preparation of scope of 
repair work on main ditch 
 

MOTION by Supervisor Determann to recess as the Board of Supervisors and convene as the Board of Trustees for 
Drainage District #23. 
 

 Roll Call: Irwin: Yes; Determann: Yes; Srp: Yes.     Motion carried. The Board of Supervisors 
recess and the Board of Trustees convened at 11:20 a.m.  
Kinney explained the scope of work to be considered in Drainage District #23. He said the project would reset the 
bottom width of the ditch as well as the banks. Kinney said there has not been a request from anyone to do the work 



 

in the middle section. Kinney believes the Board should determine an estimate to complete the work for the full 
length of the ditch and the Board could host a public meeting with the information. He said it would cost up to $1,000 
to have the cross sections drawn. Irwin said he will speak with property owners in that district before having the 
engineering ordered.  
 

MOTION by Supervisor Determann to adjourn as the Board of Trustees for Drainage District #23 and reconvene as 
the Board of Supervisors. 
 

 Roll Call: Irwin: Yes; Determann: Yes; Srp: Yes.     Motion carried. The Board of Trustees 
adjourned and the Board of Supervisors reconvened at 11:35 a.m.  
 

 The Board of Supervisors approved the following claims be allowed and checks issued on the various funds in 
payment thereof: 

Vendor Payable Description Payment Amount 
ACC 50 LLC REFUND $564.00 
ADAIR 0065 LLP REFUND $3,168.53 
ADVANCED CORRECTIONAL HEALTHCARE INC SUPPLIES $7.31 
ALDRIDGE, DAWN F MILEAGE REIMB $98.60 
ALLIANT ENERGY / INTERSTATE LIGHT/POWER CO SERVICE $14,157.39 
ANDERSON SAND & GRAVEL CO GOODS $893.76 
BARTELS, JOEY WELL PLUGGING $735.00 
BELLEVUE COMM SCHOOL DIST, LITTLE STARS PRESCHOOL SCHOLARSHIPS $500.00 
BERGERT, DALE H EXPENSE REIMB $120.49 
BERNIE'S HEATING & COOLING INC SERVICES $432.00 
BEST DISTRIBUTING INC GOODS $528.60 
BIRD, MICHAEL DEPOSIT REFUND $100.00 
BOSS INC SUPPLIES $315.16 
BRIDGEVIEW COMH CENTER SERVICES $15,257.15 
BROWN'S SHOE CO #39 SHOES $370.00 
BTX IOWA INC - BIOTECH X-RAY SERVICES $78.00 
BURMEISTER, GARY L GROUNDS CARE $180.00 
CADY, JAMES H MILEAGE/MEAL REIMB $551.61 
CALHOUN-BURNS & ASSOCIATES INC SERVICES $1,158.20 
CARDINAL PRESCHOOL, MAQUOKETA COMM SCHOOLS SCHOLARSHIPS $1,000.00 
CENTURYLINK SERVICE $791.81 
CINTAS CORPORATION LOC 23M GOODS $379.62 
CLINTON AUTO GROUP PARTS $10.46 
CLINTON CO AREA SOLID WASTE AGENCY SERVICE $139.48 
CLINTON COUNTY AUDITOR FISCAL AGENT FEES $1,960.00 
CLINTON PRINTING CO INC GOODS $140.00 
CLINTON, CITY OF SEWER SERVICE $2,337.26 
COMMUNITY ACTION OF EASTERN IA QRS $21,583.57 
COMPASS MINERALS AMERICA GOODS $25,991.55 
COMPLETE BUILDING SERVICES INC SERVICES $1,400.00 
CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS TESTING SERVICES $6,687.75 
CORNERSTONE WELLNESS CENTER SERVICES $228.50 
COX, MARTHA L, ATTORNEY AT LAW LEGAL REP $90.00 
CUNDIFF, STEVE L CLOTHING ALLOWANCE $250.00 
DABO LLC RENT $9,981.02 
DEERING, ANDREA MEI SERVICES $224.36 
DELWOOD COMMUNITY PRESCHOOL SCHOLARSHIPS $200.00 
DETERMANN ASPHALT PAVING LLC GOODS $13,165.35 
DEWITT OFFICE CENTER  SUPPLIES $23.63 
DIAMOND MOWERS INC GOODS $22,990.00 
DIERKS, KAY A MILEAGE REIMB $9.28 
DOBBINS, BART RENT ASSISTANCE $350.00 
EASTERN IOWA LIGHT & POWER UTILITY ASSISTANCE $325.00 
EASTERN IOWA OVERHEAD DOOR SERVICES $258.00 
EASTERN IOWA PETRO SERVICE $1,745.29 
EASTERN IOWA PROPANE LTD FUEL $1,272.45 
ERASMUS LAND HOLDINGS 2 LLC REFUND $1,330.00 
EVERYSTEP I SMILE $32.19 
FORTERRA PIPE & PRECAST  GOODS $29,980.00 
FOSTER, DARRON HBI REIMB $1,500.00 
FRARY LUMBER MATERIALS $573.67 
FRATIANNI, LISA TRANS ASSISTANCE $40.00 
FRENCH-RENEKER-ASSOCIATES INC SERVICES $2,925.00 
GASSER TRUE VALUE SUPPLIES $76.43 
GATEWAY SUPPLY LTD SUPPLIES $147.41 
GAUDET, EDWARD J EXPENSE REIMB $42.00 
GENESIS VNA & HOSPICE SERVICES $26,560.52 
GOLLON BAIT & FISH FARM INC SUPPLIES $178.00 
HAACK LAWN CARE LLC GOUNDS CARE $1,183.05 
HAMILTON, ASHLEY R MEALS REIMB $52.04 
HAMILTON, COLE A MEAL REIMB $42.10 
HANSEN, DAVID WELL PLUGGING $500.00 
HARTMANN, KENNETH PAYMENT REFUND $266.00 
HEALTH SOLUTIONS LLC WELLNESS PROGRAM $10,457.38 
HILLCREST FAMILY SERVICES SERVICES $12,409.78 



 

HINTZ LAWN SERVICE GROUNDS CARE $159.15 
HLUBEK, CELESTINE M MILEAGE REIMB $353.63 
HOOVER LAWN & SNOW SERVICE GROUNDS CARE $3,092.30 
HOWARD, DANNIE E MIEAL REIMB $15.18 
HR DIRECT SUPPLIES $126.32 
HY-VEE INC PRESCRIPTIONS $35.43 
ILLOWA CULVERT & SUPPLY CO GOODS $8,312.00 
IMAGINE THE POSSIBILITIES INC SERVICES $546.56 
INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY SOLUTIONS INC GOODS $144.85 
IOWA COMMUNITIES ASSURANCE POOL SERVICES $18,347.00 
IOWA PUBLIC EMPLOYER LABOR RELATIONS ASSOC REGISTRATION $50.00 
IOWA, STATE OF, DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE MANUALS $100.00 
ITSAVVY LLC EQUIPMENT $1,109.00 
J D POWER SUPPLIES $240.00 
JARED ANDERSON TRUCKING LLC MATERIALS $245.00 
JOHN DEERE FINANCIAL SUPPLIES/REPAIR SERVICE $1,071.29 
JOHN RAUSENBERGER APTS LLC RENT ASSISTANCE $200.00 
JOHNSON CO MEDICAL EXAMINER MEI SERVICES $524.71 
K & L CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS $2,230.89 
KENDRICK GENERAL PEST CONTROL SERVICES $135.00 
KENNEDY IVORY, KEHLY M MILEAGE REIMB $245.92 
KIRBY BOTTLED WATER LLC SERVICE $33.00 
KROMMINGA MOTORS, K MOTORSPORTS PARTS $263.90 
KUNAU IMPLEMENT CO INC GOODS $86,755.80 
KWIK TRIP INC FUEL $843.48 
LAMBERT, MARY ANN MILEAGE REIMB $9.28 
LARRY L DETTERMAN INC JAIL DEMOLITION $22,000.00 
LAWSON PRODUCTS INC DBA KENT AUTOMOTIVE GOODS $736.08 
LECTRONICS INC EQUIPMENT/INSTALLATION $6,043.25 
LEGISLATIVE SERVICES AGENCY REFERENCE MATERIALS $135.00 
LEIST, KYLE A MILEAGE REIMB $74.24 
LEMKE FUNERAL HOMES LLC, SOUTH CHAPEL CREMATION ASSISTANCE $1,000.00 
LINN, COUNTY OF, SHERIFF'S OFFICE TRANSPORTATION $31.16 
LOGAN CONTRACTORS SUPPLY INC SUPPLIES $3,400.00 
LOST NATION-ELWOOD TELEPHONE SERVICE $443.24 
LOVEWELL FENCING INC GOODS $240.00 
LUTHERAN SERVICES IN IOWA INC NEW PARENT PROGRAM $15,529.50 
LYNCH DALLAS PC SERVICES $350.00 
MADISON NATIONAL LIFE PREMIUMS $355.00 
MAIL SERVICES LLC SERVICES $1,676.96 
MAILFINANCE INC METER LEASE $857.19 
MALCOM, MARY E MEI SERVICES $800.00 
MANATT'S INC GOODS $5,880.25 
MAQUOKETA VALLEY ELECTRIC COOPERATIVE SERVICE $966.72 
MASTERCARD NOV PAYMENT $5,022.11 
MAYER LONERGAN & ROLFES LEGAL REP $803.00 
MCCLIMON, BRYAN P MILEAGE REIMB $246.66 
MCI COMMUNICATIONS SERVICES SERVICE $48.52 
MEDIACOM COMMUNICATIONS CORP SERVICE $373.91 
MENARD INC MATERIALS/PARTS $176.18 
MENARD INC EQUIPMENT/PARTS $300.84 
MENTAL HEALTH INSTITUTE SERVICES $50.00 
MERCY MEDICAL CENTER - CLINTON VACCINATIONS $2,375.00 
MERCYONE CLINTON SPECIALITY CARE SERVICES $902.00 
MICROAGE EQUIPMENT $1,805.95 
MIDAMERICAN ENERGY COMPANY SERVICE $2,391.55 
MIDWEST PATCH, IOWA PATCH GOODS $4,284.96 
MOORE, AARON M MILEAGE REIMB $42.92 
MORRISEY, MITCHELL GOODS $868.00 
MUSSMANN, MARISSA R CLOTHING ALLOWANCE $235.83 
MUTUAL WHEEL CO GOODS $138.04 
MYRON CORP GOODS $291.25 
NICHOLS, LORI MEAL REIMB $6.98 
O'DONNELL ACE HARDWARE SHIPPING $16.77 
OOTON, SARAH MEI SERVICES $130.80 
OSARO, ODUAH DANIEL MD STIPEND $500.00 
P & K MIDWEST INC GOODS $50.05 
PAARMANN, DAVID G GROUNDS CARE $49.40 
PENN CENTER SERVICES $2,498.00 
PETERSEN HAGGE FURNITURE PURCHASE/INSTALLATION $8,925.16 
PILLERS AND RICHMOND SERVICES $2,160.00 
PITNEY BOWES PURCHASE POWER METERED POSTAGE $33.61 
PORRIMA PROPERTIES LLP REFUND $3,164.21 
PQL INC GOODS $294.88 
PRAIRIE VIEW MANAGEMENT INC SERVICES $2,962.67 
PRAXAIR DISTRIBUTION INC EQUIPMENT RENTAL $61.72 
PRESTON READY MIX CORP GOODS $409.51 
PRICE, SHELLY J MEI SERVICES $282.10 
PROPERTY MANAGERS INC RENT ASSISTANCE $475.00 
QCI THERMAL SYSTEMS, INC MATERIALS $310.00 
QUAD CITY TESTING LAB INC SERVICES $551.00 
QUILL CORPORATION SUPPLIES $955.71 



 

RACOM CORPORATION SERVICES $1,825.79 
RAMIREZ, STEPHEN M MEI SERVICES $153.10 
RAY O'HERRON CO INC SUPPLIES $83.40 
RICOH USA INC COPIER LEASE $223.89 
RK DIXON SUPPLIES $120.68 
ROGIS, DAVID GLEN MEI SERVICES $511.60 
RYDER, PAMELA K MILEAGE REIMB $11.60 
SACRED HEART PRESCHOOL SCHOLARSHIPS $300.00 
SCHMIDT, JILL E MEAL REIMB $44.60 
SCHOENAUER, KENNETH F  P C LEGAL REP $354.00 
SCOTT COUNTY SHERIFF TRANSPORTATION $36.07 
SECRETARY OF STATE NOTARY RENEWAL $30.00 
SHERWIN WILLIAMS MATERIALS $28.96 
SHRED-IT USA LLC SERVICES $1,176.02 
SHUTTLEWORTH & INGERSOLL PLC LEGAL SERVICES $4,152.50 
SKYLINE CENTER INC SERVICES $21,370.35 
SOENKSEN, ALLAN L MEAL REIMB $10.00 
SPAHN & ROSE LUMBER CO GOODS $59.29 
ST  PAUL'S CEMETERY, ST PAUL'S U C C SERVICEMEN'S GRAVE CARE $800.00 
STANARD & ASSOCIATES INC SUPPLIES $752.50 
STANKEE, CHRISTY MEI SERVICES $141.18 
STATE HYGIENIC LABORATORY TESTING $2,795.00 
STETSON BUILDING PRODUCTS INC GOODS $220.00 
STORJOHANN, JAIMIE M MEAL REIMB $10.00 
THE GARAGE INC VEHICLE MAINT $401.79 
THILTGEN, DONALD MILEAGE REIMB $23.20 
TIESMAN, BRIAN EXPENSE REIMB $53.90 
TOTAL SEPTIC SERVICE SERVICES $600.81 
TRAVEL INN CLINTON - SHAH, PANKAJ C SERVICES $554.40 
TREASURER STATE OF IOWA INDIGENT DEFENSE FUND $90,717.00 
TRUCK COUNTRY OF IOWA GOODS $75.93 
TWIN BRIDGES TRUCK CITY INC GOODS $417.67 
TWINSTATE TECHNICAL SERVICES LTD SERVICES $50.00 
ULINE INC SUPPLIES $1,568.02 
UNIFORM DEN INC UNIFORM ACCESSORIES $750.45 
UNITED RENTALS NORTH AMERICA INC EQUIPMENT RENTAL $404.40 
VAN LANCKER, ERIC MILEAGE REIMB $220.40 
VAN METER INC FREIGHT $11.78 
VANGUARD APPRAISALS INC SERVICES $27,999.90 
VERA FRENCH COMMUNITY MENTAL HEALTH CENTER SERVICES $793.00 
VERIZON WIRELESS SERVICE $1,615.94 
WAINWRIGHT, SCOTT L CLOTHING ALLOWANCE $150.00 
WELLS FARGO FINANCIAL LEASING INC COPIER LEASE $262.88 
WENDLING QUARRIES INC GOODS $40,153.89 
WENZEL, WILLIAM D GROUNDS CARE $462.75 
WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION  GOODS $41.99 
WIEGE, DALE DBA WIEGE PROPERTIES RENT ASSISTANCE $400.00 
WILKE, TOBY A MEAL REIMB $63.02 
WILLIS, DANIAL J L MEAL REIMB $56.67 
WINDSTREAM IOWA COMMUNICATIONS INC SERVICE $182.62 
WYOMING WELDING INC MATERIALS $472.50 
XEROX CORPORATION COPIER LEASE $66.03 
YWCA CLINTON CHILDRENS CTR CHILD CARE $5,436.75 
YWCA, CLINTON CHILDRENS' CENTER SCHOLARSHIPS $800.00 
ZION CHILD CARE PRESCHOOL SCHOLARSHIPS $300.00 
ZUERCHER TECHNOLOGIES LLC SUBSCRIPTION $303.78 

 
Grand Total: $681,570.32 

Fund Expense Amount 
 0001  GENERAL BASIC $87,415.39 
 0002  GENERAL SUPPLEMENTAL $113,346.01 
 0010  MH-DD SERVICES FUND $57,954.88 
 0020  SECONDARY ROADS $258,396.99 
 0021  PIONEER CEMETERY $5,492.14 
 0023  REAP $2,874.35 
 1500  CAPITAL PROJECTS FUND $36,968.41 
 4000  EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT SERVICES $3,766.79 
 4010  E911 $2,434.66 
 4100  COUNTY ASSESSOR $28,540.92 
 5120  SCHOOL READY $48,243.12 
 5121  EARLY CHILDHOOD IOWA $9,612.89 
 7300  REFUND CLEARING $8,492.74 
 8000  ENTERPRISE FUND - ROCK CREEK $4,843.65 
 8500  CLINTON COUNTY BENEFIT TRUST $13,187.38 
 Grand Total: $681,570.32 
  

 Roll Call: Irwin: Yes; Determann: Yes; Srp: Yes.    Motion carried. 
 

I, Eric Van Lancker, Clinton County Auditor, do hereby certify this to be a complete and accurate list of all claims 
presented to the Clinton County Board of Supervisors on this date. Signed: Eric Van Lancker, Clinton County 
Auditor 
 



 

 The Board of Supervisors adjourned to meet on Monday, December 9, 2019.   

Eric Van Lancker, County Auditor                Daniel A. Srp, Chairperson 
-APPROVED- 

 
 
___________________________          ____________________________ 
County Auditor                 Chairperson 


